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Annexure 8.12: Guidelines for Siting & Layout of Construction Camp

SITING

The contractor based on the following guidelines shall identify the location of the construction site. The construction site shall 
be located:

 The construction camps will be located at least 500 m away from habitations at identified sites. The living accommodation 
and ancillary facilities for labour shall  be erected and maintained to standards and scales approved by the resident 
engineer. 

 On non agricultural lands, as far as possible

 All sites used for camps must be adequately drained. They must not be subject to periodic flooding, nor located within 300 
feet of pools, sink holes or other surface collections of water unless such water surface can be subjected to mosquito 
control measures.

 The camps must be located such that the drainage from and through the camps will not endanger any domestic or public 
water supply.

 All sites must be graded, ditched and rendered free from depressions such that water may get stagnant and become a 
nuisance.

(B) LAYOUT

A conceptual layout of a typical construction site has been presented in Figure A. The Contractor during the progress of work  
will provide, erect and maintain necessary (temporary) living accommodation and ancillary facilities for labour to standards and 
scales approved by the engineer. All temporary accommodation must be constructed and maintained in such a fashion that 
uncontaminated water is available for drinking, cooking and washing. Safe drinking water should be provided to the dwellers of 
the construction camps. Adequate washing and bathing places shall be provided, and kept in clean and drained condition. 
Construction camps are to be sited away from vulnerable people and adequate health care is to be provided for the work  
force.

Sanitation Facilities: Construction camps shall be provided sanitary latrines and urinals. Sewerage drains should be provided 
for the flow of used water outside the camp. Drains and ditches should be treated with bleaching powder on a regular basis. 
The sewage system for the camp must be properly designed, built and operated so that no health hazard occurs and no 
pollution to the air, ground or adjacent watercourses takes place. Compliance with the relevant legislation must be strictly 
adhered to. Garbage bins must be provided in the camp and regularly emptied and the garbage disposed off in a hygienic  
manner

Shelter at Workplace: At every workplace, there shall be provided free of cost, four suitable shelters, two for meals and two 
others for rest, separately for use of men and women labourers. The height of shelter shall not be less than 3m from floor level  
to lowest part of the roof. Sheds shall be kept clean and the space provided shall be on the basis of at least 0.5m2 per head.

Canteen Facilities: A cooked food canteen on a moderate scale shall be provided for the benefit of workers wherever it is  
considered necessary. The contractor shall conform generally to sanitary requirements of local medical, health and municipal 
authorities and at all times adopt such precautions as may be necessary to prevent soil pollution of the site.

First aid facilities: At every workplace, a readily available first-aid unit including an adequate supply of sterilized dressing 
materials and appliances will be provided as per the Factory Rules. Workplaces remote and far away from regular hospitals 
will have indoor health units with one bed for every 250 workers. Suitable transport will be provided to facilitate taking injured 
and ill  persons to the nearest hospital.  At every workplace an ambulance room containing the prescribed equipment and 
nursing staff will be provided.

Health Care Facilities: Health problems of the workers should be taken care of by providing basic health care facilities through 
health centres temporarily set up for the construction camp. The health centre should have at least a doctor, nurses, duty staff, 
medicines and minimum medical facilities to tackle first-aid requirements or minor accidental  cases, linkage with  nearest 
higher order hospital to refer patients of major illnesses or critical cases.

The health centre should have MCW (Mother and Child Welfare) units for treating mothers and children in the camp. Apart 
from this, the health centre should provide with regular vaccinations required for children.
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Day Crèche Facilities: At every construction site, provision of a day crèche shall be worked out so as to enable women to 
leave behind their children. At construction sites where 20 or more women are ordinarily employed, there shall be provided at  
least a hut for use of children under the age of 6 years belonging to such women. Huts shall not be constructed to a standard 
lower than that of thatched roof, mud walls and floor with wooden planks spread over mud floor and covered with matting. Huts 
shall be provided with suitable and sufficient openings for light and ventilation. There shall be adequate provision of sweepers 
to keep the places clean. There shall be two maidservants (or aayas) in the satisfaction of local medical, health, municipal or  
cantonment authorities. Where the number of women workers is more than 25 but less than 50, the contractor shall provide  
with at least one hut and one maidservant to look after the children of women workers. Size of crèches shall vary according to 
the number of women workers employed. 

 

FIGURE A: TYPICAL LAYOUT OF CONSTRUCTION CAMP
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